BID TABULATION - HYDRAULIC AND ELECTRICAL PARTS AND SUPPLIES

HYDRAULIC PARTS & SUFPLIES | CERTIFIED POWER [ AUTOTIRE& PARTS| SUFIORIND: I IMI;EEPR'SES WM NOBBE & CO nggﬁiﬁ‘%"m
12-18-12
Contract term 1-1-13 to 12-31-13 upon
approval by the County Council and 4035 FEB FHE RD 112 S KINGSHWY 8525 VULCANST | 3023DELMARELYD | 115 METROPCLITAN | 12615STATERTA | 2525 NATURAL BRIDGE
County Executive BRIDGETON MO CAPE GIRARDEAU MO STLOUIS MO ST LOUTS MO LIVERPOOL NY ST GENEVIEVE MO ST LOUTS MO
63044 63701 63113 63103 13088 63670 63107
HYDRAULIC HOSE
172" inch TD 2 braid hose
Cost per Foot 5445 $3.05 $2.86 $3.00 $1.30 $4.11 $3.16
Foot per Roll $2,225.00 220 250 330 $1.30 400 250
Manufacturer Conplamatic Gates Eaton/WH Gates MZT IGB Parker Goodyear
34" inch 1D 2 braid hose
Cost per Foot $7.98 $4.86 $4.58 $4.97 $1.98 $6.67 $4.17
Foot per Roli $3,990.00 220 250 220 $1.98 230 250
Manufacturer Couplamatic Gates Eaton/WH Gates M2T IGB Parker Goodyear
MYDRAULIC MOTORS/TUMPS
White Hydraulics RS0301210
List Price $553.68 N/A - NG BID NO BID $474.5% N/A
Discount 33% N/A - NO BID NO BID 33 1.6'-1 N/A
Net Price $370.97 N/A - NO BID NO BID $442.95 N/A
PTO Pump Chelsca 4428RIWX-W5XK
List Price $902.37 N/A - NOBID NO BID $612.33 $751.97
Discomnt 50% WA - NO BID NO BID $40.82 -40%
Net Price £451.19 N/A - NO BID NO BID $571.51 $451.18
Eaton Spimmer Motor 101 1003 009
List Price $319.00 N/A - NO BID $297.91 $364.57 $452.00
Discount 20% WA - NO BID - $24.30 -40%
Mel Price $255,20 A - NO BID $279.08 $340.27 $§271.20
“White Hysraulics R50185
" ListPrice - N/A - NO BID NO BID - WA
Discount - N/A - NO BID NO BID - N/A
Net Price - NIA - NOBID NO BID - MN/A
HYDRAULIC FITTINGS
#8 (112 inch} Straight MP
List Price $3.55 $13.49 - $7.87 $4.89 $6,22 $10.63
Discoant 50% $9.83 . 58% - £1,34 -63.5%
Net Price $1.78 5366 5178 ea $3.31 52,28 $4.88 $3.88
#8 (1/2 inch) 45 degree MP
List Price $12.16 NA - NOT MADE NO BID NOT AVAILABLE $17.67
Discount 50% NIA - NOT MADE NO BID NOT AVAILABLE -63.5%
Met Price $6.08 NIA $5.89 NOT MADE NO BID MOT AVAILABLE $6.45
#8 (1/2 inch) 90 depree MP
List Price $8.31 $50.24 - NOT MADE $14.17 $26.20 £26.60
Discount 50% $36.57 - NOT MADE - $5.64 -63.5%
Net Price $4.16 $13.67 $5.7 NOT MADE $5.88 $20.56 $9.71
#12 (3/4 inch) Straight MP
List Price $5.15 $24.74 - $14.64 $8.17 $10,72 $7.94
Disconnt 50% $17.84 - 58% - $231 -63.5%
Net Price $2.58 $6.90 $2.47 $6.15 $3.81 58.41 $2.90




BID TABULATION - HYDRAULIC AND ELECTRICAL PARTS AND SUPPLIES

HYDRAULIC PARTS & SUPPLIES SUPERIOR IND. G&R JGB INTERPRISES TRACTOR TRAILER
TIRE & PARTS
BID OPENING CERTIFIED FOWER AUTO SUPFLY INDUSTRIAL INC WM NOBBE & CO SUPPLY CO
12-18-12
Cantract term 1-1-13 ¢n 12.31-13 unnn
#12 (3/4 inch) 45 degree MP
List Price $26.06 N/A - NOT MADE NO BID NOT AVATLABLE $17.04
Discount 50% N/A - NOT MADE NO BID NOT AVAILABLE -63.5%
Net Price $13.03 N/A 58.09 NOT MADE NG BID NOT AVAILABLE 86,22
#12 (374 inch) 90 degree MP
List Price $14.15 $89.99 - NOT MADE $29.18 $43.64 $24.25
Discount 50% $64.55 - NOT MADE - $9.39 -63.5%
Net Price 51.08 $25.44 $7.60 NOT MADE $13.61 $34.25 $8.85
#16 (1 inch) Straight MP
List Price $7.80 $47.99 - $2838 $12.21 $23.28 $12.97
Discount 50% 534.65 - 58% - $5.01 -63.5%
Net Price $3.90 $13.34 $3.69 $11.92 $5.69 $18.27 $4.74
#16 (1 inch) 45 degree MP
List Price $14.65 N/A - NOT MADE NO BID NOT AVAILABLE $41.42
Discount 50% N/A - NOT MADE NO BID NOT AVAILABLE -63.5%
Net Price $7.33 MN/A $13,17 NOT MADE NO BID NOT AVAILABLE $15.12
#16 (1 inch) 90 degree MP
List Price $21.05 N/A . NOT MADE $24.42 $106.26 $36.90
Discount 50% N/A - NOT MADE - $23.24 -63.5%
Nei Price $10.53 N/A $14.05 NOT MADE $E4.45 $83.62 513.47
#8 MP - #8 FPX 90 degree
List Piice $6.80 $12.74 - £6.04 $13.65 $9.24 $4.63
Disconng 50% $9.25 - 48% “ $2.07 -63.5%
Net Price $3.40 $3.4% ta.85 $3.14 $1.64 $7.57 SE.69
#12 MP - #12 FPX 90 depree
List Price 31125 $20.24 - $10.06 $24.09 315.26 $8.63
Discownt 50% 514.78 - 43% - $3.28 -63.5%
Net Price 3563 §5.46 58.02 $5.23 $£2.55 511,98 $3.15
#8 MD - #8 FIX 90 degree
List Price $9.06 58.99 - $23.40 513,10 NOT AVAILABLE $30.36
Discount 50% $6.65 - 58% - NOT AVAILABLE -63,5%
Nek Price $4.50 5234 $5.82 $9.83 $6.12 NOT AVAILABLE 511,08
#8 MP QD MALE
List Pricc $10.30 $20,24 - §12.56 $20.50 $7.96 $40.11
Discount 20% 514,61 - ad% - 50.49 -61.9%
Net Price $8.64 $5.63 511.48 $4.52 $9.03 $7.47 $15.28
#8 MP QD FEMALE
List Price $24.50 $43.49 - $26.75 $50.00 $18.31 $91.50
Discount 20% $31.28 - 64% - $1.10 -61.9%
Net Price $19.60 $12.21 $27.50 2.63 $22.00 §17.21 $36.60
#12 MF QD MALE
List Price $16.40 $68.99 - $26.75 $30.50 $25.55 $366.84
Discount 20% $49.54 - 64% - $1.53 -61.9%
Net Price $13.12 $19.45 $23.23 $9.63 $10.23 $24.02 $139.75
#12 MI' QD FEMALE
List Price §38.50 $148.49 - $52.41 $75.00 $56.38 $430.36
Discount 20% $106,15 - 64% - $3.38 -61.9%
Net Price $30.80 $42.34 $37.10 $18.87 $25.17 $53.00 $163.95




BID TABULATION - HYDRAULIC AND ELECTRICAL PARTS AND SUPPLIES

HYDRAULIC PARTS & SUPPLIES SUPERIOR IND. G&R JGB INTERPRISES TRACTOR TRAILER
BID OPE G CERTIFIED POWER AUTO TIRE & PARTS SUPPLY INDUSTRIAL Ne WM NOBEE & CO SUPPLY CO
12-18-12
Confract tarm 1-1-13 ta 12-31-13 unnn
GLAO0 JCH Brand-Storm guard
List Price $2,450,00 NiA - NO BID NOBID $1,452.50 N/A
Discount 30% NIA - NOBID NO BID $06.83 N/A
Net Price $1,715.00 NIA - NOBID NOBID $1,355.67 N/A
Freedom Conizol 2,1
List Price $1,563.28 NfA - NC BID NO BID $1,004.97 N/A
Dizcount 40% N/A . NO BID NO BID $67.00 NFA
Net Price $937.97 N/A - NO BID NO BID $937.97 N/A
Freedom Control 2.2
List Price $1,963.28 N/A - NO BID NO BID $1,262.11 N/A
Diseount 40% NIA - NO BID NQ BID 384,14 N/A
Net Price $1,177.97 N/A - NO BID NO BID $1,177.97 N/A
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES NO NO YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED NO NO NO YES NO NO YES
C1:I.|Tﬁrlt old stock Lift out- Aute Tire & Parts will
Certified Power does nat have lift out and mive out
a mechanism for the removal ce
. . 100% eredit for any 1
of your old inventory since | . . i
do not inventory the Gates piece hydraulic fittings.
we Auto Tire & Parts can
product we would net have a : .
N not give credit on cut
market for that product [ine i
offering hose, hose assemblies,
Hydraulic Hose Machines- ;:ﬂiplei [:zld';frl:z #8 - #8 F3X
Certified Power can only P mis'wi; rovide list price-$10.73
offer new eqipment {o be sold ecess cP;im ers discount~58%
te Jefferson County. dies, an {la?l;up sal:vs t,'or net price-§4.52
Stationary machines complete ? SEE #12 - #12 F3X .
COMMENTS: with collets to crimp the customers needs, All ATTACIMENT Jist price -$18.28 SEE ATTACHMENT SEE ATTACHMENT

Couplamatic product line
from 1/4" - 1 1/4" sizes would
cost $6,129.81. Porlable
machines complete with
collets and hand pump to
crimp Couplamatic praduct
line from 14" - 1 1/4" sizes
would cost $4,485.15. An
opiion price of an additional
$302.64 for the air over
hydranlic pamp supply.

equipment provided
will be the praperty of
Auto Tire & Parts, Auic
Tire & Parts will
replace equipment
when necessary,
Jefferson County may
use cquipment as long
as they agree to
purchase hydranlic
fittings and hose from
Auto Tire & Parts.

discount-58%
net price-$7,68
SEE ATTACHMENT




8525 Vulcan St.
St. Louis, Missouri 63111

SUPERIOR p 314.638.6500

INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY f 314.638.3110
Service is the difference www.sisuppiy.com
Hydraulic Hose Machine

Superior Industrial Supply will provide to the Jefferson County Highway Department
Main Service Shop an Eaton/Weatherhead model #5T420-005 crimper with
electric/hydraulic pump and crimp collets with capacity % ID thru 1-1/4” ID for EN 853
style 2-wire braid hydraulic hose.

The #ET420-005 will be placed on loan to Jefferson County, and remains the property of
Superior Industrial Supply.

All repairs and maintenance to the #ET420-005 will be the responsibility of the Jefferson
County Highway Department.

Additional hose crimping and cutting equipment for service trucks may be purchased at
cost from Superior Industrial Supply as follows:

Model #ET1000-16 Hand Pump Unit w/Tooling $3,160.00 ea.
Model #E1T1000-17 Air Pump Unit w/Tooling $3,495.00 ca.
Model #TGA02335 Metabo 14” Heavy Duty Chop Saw $225.00 ea.

Old Stock Lift (Hose and fittings only)

Superior Industrial Supply will, at no cost to Jefferson County, inventory all items to be
lifted, identify what is obsolete and what can be sold, and identify the best outlets and
channels to maximize return on saleable inventory.

Proceeds from the sale of the inventory will be credited to Jefferson County’s account
with Superior Industrial Supply.

Documentation

All documentation, including E-Verify, insurance certificates, affidavit of work
authorization, and notary, will be provided upon award of bid.



Crimping Machines - Stationary
Coll-O-Crimip Super |, T-420

A

Refer to pages A-2 and A-3
and machine operator's

manuals for safety information.

T-420 © Coll-O-Crimp Super | Paclkages for Z-Serias
-4 thru -16 {no -10}, ona-wire and two-wire

The Coll-O-Crimp Super |
is a versatile machine ideal
for your shop, factery,
construction, and mine
iocations. Big capacity
combined with lever-
activated crimping gives
you wide coverage and a
quick and simple way to
make factory-quality hose

Capacity

3/16° 1.D. 1 fiber braid
through 1-1/4" 6 spiral hose*;
for hose other than 4 and 6
spiral, conversion tooling is
reguired. See page N-36 for
details.

*Will not crimp 45P/6SP ands

Mounting

Bench or C-40X cabinet.

See pages N-68-70 for
cabinet {not included).

Size

22" high, 10" wide, 20-1/2" deep
Woaeight

210 Ibs.

A CAUTION

The Coll-O-Crimp power
source has tha pressure relief
vaive set at 4000 to 4200 PSI.
Damage to the press will result

Package

Number ET420-002 ET420-003
Power Source 220V 110V
Contents Press T-420-1 T-420-1

Hose Assembly 1-410-22 T-410-22
Pump T-421U T-421U-110
Adapter Ring T-420-25 1-420-25
Z-Series Collets™ ETA20TP-0001 ET420TP-0001
* See page N-30

T-420-N ¢ Coll-O-Crimp Super | - 220V Package
T-420N-110 ¢ Coli-O-Crimp Super | - 110V Package

Includes one each of the following (with respactive pumpi:

assemblies.

if higher pressuras are used
and warranty will be voided.

ET420-004 Coll-O-Crimp | - 220V Package
ET420-005 Coii-O-Crimp | - 110V Package

Both Packages include the following {with respective pump);

Catalog Catalog

Number Deascription Mumber Description

T-4206-1 Coll-O-Crimp Super [ Press and T-420-M stractions T-420-1 Colf-0-Crimp Super |

T-421U or T-421U-110 220v or 110V Electric Pump 41U or T-421U-110 220v or 110V Electric Pump

T-400-2C *L* Series Collet— 1/4" ETAGODC-MIB0S 7 Series Collet—1/4"

T-400-3C “U" Series Collet— 3/8° EFADODC-MM1955 ‘7' Series Collet—3/8"

T-400-4C “l¥" Series Collet— 1/2 ETA00DC-M230S ‘7" Series Collst-1/2"

T-408-5C " Series Collet— 3/4" T-420-85C ‘7' Series Collet—5/8"

T-400-6C *IF Series Collet—-1° T-420-86C ‘7’ Series Collet—3/4"

T-400-10 Spacer Ring—Black FT420DC-M380S 7 Series Collet— 1"

T-400-11 Spacer Ring— Silver T-400-16 Spacer Ring— Black

T-400-62 Spacer Ring Yellow T-400-62 Spacer Ring—Yeilow

T-410-22 36° Pump to Press Hose Assembly T-420-B0R Spacer Ring— Black/White

1-420-25 Adapler Ring for 7-400 Series Collets ET1000SR-M198D  Spacer Ring— Light Green

T-420-4CN 430 "IF Series Collet—1/2" FTA2068-M255A  Spacer Bing— Black/Gray

T-420-50N 430 U Series Collei—3/4" ET470SR-M495A  Spacer Ring— Brown

T-420-6CN 430°U" Series Collet— 1" T-410-22 36" Pump to Press Hose Assembly

T-420-7CN 430 °U’ Series Collet—1-1/4" T-420-75 Adapter Ring for T-400 Series Coilets
T-420-4CN 430 ‘U’ Series Collet- 1/2*
T-420-50N 430 'V’ Series Collet—3/4"
T-420-6CN 430 ‘U Series Collet— 1"
T-420-7CN 430 "I Series Collet—1-1/4"

EATON Weatherhead Hoss Assembly Master Catalog W-HYQVMC002-E2 February 2011
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Crimping Machines - Portable
ET1000 Portable Crimp Machine

ET1000 ¢ Portable Crimp
Machine

A\ caumon

Refer to pages A-2 and A-3 and
mathine operator's manuals for
safety information.

Ordering Gptions

The completely PORTABLE
ET1000 crimp machine
hoasts a broad erimp
capability with an ease-of-
use that is sure to please
hose assemblers, With three
power source options - air/
hydraulic, hand, and electric
- this portable machine can
travel to the worksite, The
machine comes equipped
with a stand pre-drilied for
mounting to & workbench or
table-top.

The ET1000 Portable Crimp
Machine is a mid-size
machine positionad between
the other two popular
portable crimp machines {the
T-466 and T-480).

Capacity

Coll-O-Crimp U series hose
ends and applicable hoses in
sizes 1/4" through 1-1/4"

Coll-Q-Crimp Z Series hose
ends and applicable hoses in
sizas 1/4" through 1-1/4”

Coli-O-Crimp 430U Series
hose ends and applicable
hoses in sizes 3/8” through
34"

Mounting

Work bench or table top
Weight

70 lbs. {less pump}
Tooling

Standard Col-O-Crimp
collets and spacer rings.

Uses the same tooling as the
T-420 rnachina.

Repair and replacement items

Pump Kits

(purnp kits contain hose
assambly and fittings to
attach pump toe maching}

ET1000PK-001
Hand Pump

ET1000PK-602,
AirfHydraulic Pump

ET1000PK-003
110 Volf Electric Pump

Pump Only
{dees not include hose
assembly or fittings}

T-480-2
Hand Pump

T-482-2

Air/Hydraulic Pump
T-481-110

110 Vaolt Electric Pump

ET1000C-0001 Stand

ET1000-001 Basic machine {no pump)
ET1000-002 Macthine with hand pump”™ ET1000C-0006 Pusher
ET1000-003 Machine with aig/hydraufic purap® ET100DAR-0D1 Adapter Ring
ET1000-004 Machine with 110 valt efectric pump™ T-400-G 1.5 oz. Tube High Efficiency Teflon® Grease
? * inciudas hose assembly and fittings te attach purmgp te machine, Additional repair and replacement items are available. Refer to the owner's
g manual or confact Eaton for information.
= Note: Collats and spacers not included in kits. Must be ordered separately.  Telon®is a eegistered adematk of DuPont used under license by Eatan.
§F  Seepages N-26-32 for part numbers.
= Note: ET1000AR-001 adapter die ring requi i
: pter die ring required to Crimp T-400 and ETA00 . 3
_g' series collets. Not included in kits and must be ordered separately. ET1000 » Portable Coll-O-Crimp Packages for Z-Series
= -4 thru -16 {na ~10}, one-wire and two-wire
° Baclage
= Mumber ET1000-016  ET1000-017  ET1000-018
g Power Source Hand Pump AirfHydraulic 110y
wh Contents Press, ET1000-002 £T1000-003 ET1000-004
Pump and Hose Assembly
Adapter Ring ETIOD0AR-G01  ETIO0OAR-001  FT1000AR-001
ET1000TR-0001  EFTO00TP-G0O1  ETIB00TP-00

Z-Series Collats®
01

* See page N-30

N-16 EATON Waatherhead Hose Assembly Master Catalog W-HYOVW-MCG02-E3 February 20H



G&R INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY CO. INC.
3023 DELMAR BLVD.
ST.LOUIS, MO 63103

oy, (FIUSTRIALSVERLY 1C 7

EMAIL: GRINDUSTRIAL@ATT.NET

Current Old Stock Lift out:

Not applicable because your old stock is the same Manufacturer that we are quoting.

Hydraulic Hose Machines:

We will loan out 7 portable crimp machines (4-20 crimper) and 1 shop mounted crimp machine
(PC707) with a stock up order of $6500.00.

Each machine will be brand new and include dies to crimp 4" to 1” diameter hose. The portable
crimp machines will include a new shop air pump for each machine. The shop mounted machine

will include a new 115v pump.

These machines will remain the property of G & R Industrial Supply Co.

Chop Saw;

Please see specifications on attached sheet.

Price: $700.00



JIPMENT

-] o a
HOSE/CPLG. bilel ® 4-20 Crime
wszens. | MgileCrimp® 4-20 Crimper
ggﬁpuuss This lightweight, versatile crimper is powerful enough
to crimp up to 1-1/4” four spiral-wire hose Weighing
—GLOBALSPIRAL | —Epproximately-5 —this-new-field-eri
COUPLINGS combines the latest crimping technology with old-
fashioned toughness and durability.
PEMIPCS
FERRULES
MEGAGRIMP ioii=l DO
MEBAGRI Digital Dial Control
Just dial in appropriate crimp setting and hold
:IQL'\:LESS the start button until light comes on and buzzer
sounds, then release. Ability to tock-in setting
POWER for multiple assemblies. Light and buzzer
CRIMP operate on two "AAA” batteries,
COUPLINGS
LOC, GLAND Product Number: 7480-0051
GLP
COUPLINGS
POLARSEAL
COUPLINGS
POLARSEAL
It GOUPLINGS Crimper-to-Pump Maie Quick Disconnect 7252-8831
c14 Crimper-to-Pump Female Guick Disconnsct 7252-8830
COUPLINGS
PLTS
THEAMD- = a ®
PLASTIC MobileCrimp® 4-20 Die Selection Table
COUPLINGS P . ) .
For MegaCGrimp® (G25) Gouplings For GlobalSpiral™ (G20) Couplings
FIELD Hose Sizes Hose Sizes
ATTACHABLE Hose Hose
61 AND G2 Type 1/4" 3/8” 1/2" | 58" | a3 1" | 1-1747  Type 38" 1/2" | b/8" [ 34" 1" 1114
COUPLINGS M3K  MC21 or MC31 | MG22orMC32 | MC33 | MC34 | MC35 | MC3T | — EFGEK MC33 [ MC33 | MC35 | MG3S | MGI7 | —
MZT__MC21 or MC31 | MC22 o NIG32 | MC33 | WGad | MGas | Mcar | —  FFGoK MC33 | MC33 | mcss | Me3s | mcar | —
FELD Gl MCZi or MC31 | MG22 or MC32 | MC33 | MC3Z | WCab | MGa7 | MGAG  EFGAK  WCa3 | MCI3 | MG35 | MC35 | MG37 | MGags
g;r:g:gés G2 MC21orMC31 | MC22orMC32 | MC33 | MC34 I Mcas I mc37 | MG39 “MBS (621 serles) couplings only,
i For other hose and coupling configurations, reference www.gates.com/ecrimp or
COUPLINGS Gates criimp data manual, ° P
SURELOK AIR o
BRAKE Die Sets {arderes saparaizly)
COUPLINGS
Die Set MC21/ME31 MC22/MC32 MC33 MC34 MC35 Mca7 Mc39
ADAPTERS Product No.  7482-1220A1018 7482-1221/1018  7482-1133 7482-1134 7482-1135 74821137 7482-1139
QUICK
DISCONNECT
COUFLERS
LIVE SWIVEL
BALL VALVES
ACCESSORIES
EQUIPMENT
AND PARTS
e
%

gates.com/hydraulics

Gates Carporation



MobileGrimp® 4-20 Power Sources

Wide selection of pumps to match ail your power needs.

Hand Pumip

EQUIPMENT

HOSE/GPLE.
SELECTION

G8K
COUPLINGS

GLOBALSPRAL

No power source needed. Economical, convenient and
portable for use anywhere. Make factory-quality assem-
blies in the field to minimize downtime.

Product Number: 7481-0006
Pressure Rating: 10,000 pst
Weight: 25.6 lbs.

hop Air Pump
Works off standard shop air si). Economical,
i fleTGr use wheraver 90 psi

compressed air is available.

Product Number: 7481-0002
Pressure Rating: 10,000 psi
Weight: 10 Ibs.

1/2 KP 115 Volt AC Pump
Medium speed. Economical. Recommended for a stationary or
mobile application.

Product Number: 7481-0034
Pressure Rating: 10,000 psi
Weight: 32 Ibs.

1-1/2 HP 115 Volt AC Pump

High speed. Recommended for stationary applications only.

Product Number: 7481-0035
Pressure Rating: 10,000 psi
Weight: 108 Ibs.

1/4 HP 12 Volt DG Pump
Mobile operation, runs on standard 12 volt car/truck battery ora 12
volt portable battery pack. Ideal for teugh jobs in the field.

Product Number: 7481-0037
Pressure Rating: 10,000 psi
Weight: 20.5 |bs.

%‘ Powering Progress. gates.com/hydraulics

COUPLINGS

PCM/PCS
FERRULES

MEGACRIMP
COUPLINGS

STAINLESS
STEEL

POWER
CRIMP
COUPLINGS

LOC, GL AND
GLP
COUPLINGS

POLARSEAL
COUPLINGS

POLARSEAL I
COUPLINGS

G4
COUPLINGS

PCTS
THERMO-
PLASTIC
COUPLINGS

FIELD
ATTACHABLE
G1AND G2
COUPLINGS

FIELD
ATTACHABLE
£5AND C5E
COUPLINGS
SURELOK AIR
BRAKE
COUPLINGS
ADAPTERS
QUICK
DISCONNECT
COUPLERS
LIVE SWIVEL
BALL VALVES

ACCESSORIES

EQUIPMENT
AND PARTS




EQUIPMENT

HOSE/CPLS. ® 7
wseneis. | Powyer Grimp® 707
K Gates Power Crimp 707 s the @ PC707 = SPECIFICATIONS
COUPLINGS most precise, yet simplest crimper T L
- made. It was .the first crimpgr vyith £ = Product Number: 7480-0043
mslw & A it = Standard PC707 Winout dis s&1s
cale gauge seting. . = wired for 115 volts {includes die
PCM/PCS The toughest part about using the = backup ring and a notched cong),
FERRULES 707 is pushing a button. It takes -
just a few seconds to make factory- = Production Rate: 100 assemblies per
MEGACRIMP quality hose assemblfies. hour {using 1/2" .D. two-wire straight
COUPLINGS Grimps most hydraulic hoses thread 'assembhe.s).
from low pressure return lines to Dimensions: 13" wide by 12" deep by
STAINLESS ; X g
STEEL extremely high pressure spirals, 26-1/2” high.
] from 3/16" to 1-1/4” 1.D. Crimps : Weight: 188 Ibs.
POWER straight and bent tube couplings,
CRIMP plus 45° and 80° block types. 2 ]
COUFLINGS Can also be adapted for use as a - PC707 230V Converter Kit
LOC, GLAND POWEr Swager. Converts crimper and pump
GLP Product Number: 7482-0499
COUPLINGS
| Power Crimp® 707 Die Selection Table
COUPLINGS . . . :
For MegaCrimp® (G25) Couplings For GlohalSpiral™ {G20) Gouplings
POLARSEAL Hose Sizes Hose Sizes
if COUPLINGS HOSE poa—
Type 14 38" 2 | 58 | a | 1" | 14" Type 3@ | 1/2r | sme | s | v 1-174
Ci4 MK o | a7 | 133 734 | 735 | 737 | — EFGBK_ 735 | /a3 | 785 | 75 | 7a7 —
COUPLINGS MT  7210r731 | 7220r732 | 733 73 [ 7 | nr | - EFGSK 733 | 733 | 735 | 735 | 737 —
Gl 720730 | 7220r732 | 733 734 | 735 | 737 | 739 EFedK 738 | 723 | 735 | 735 | 7% 739
PCTS 62 72100731 | 7220r732 | 733 73¢ | s | v ] 3w
THERMO-
PLASTIC For other hose and coupling configurations, reference wwrw.gates.com/ecrimyp or Gates crimp cfata manual.
COUPLINGS o
HELD 7 @—g@ﬁ% {ordered separately) _
iy e s e ms  mr e
COUPLINGS 1=2-TB-/0932-. _?482»_@933 | 7452-09% 74B2:0935  7482-0037  7482-D93%
FIELD
ATTACHABLE
ggﬁg‘ﬂuf: Die Cones:  No-Notch Product Number: 7482-0297.
Notched Product Number: 7482-0239.
SURELOK AIR
BRAKE a
arnes | POWEE CHMP® Power Source  SPECIFicaTIONs
The flows of two fixed displacement pumps are com-
ADAFTERS . . . . Product Number: 7481-0023
?lned to dellvgr a high volume of oil at low pressure for (115 volt, 30 amp, circLit, 1 h.p., 80 cycles)
QUICK ast transversion. . e " " o
DISCONNECT Dimensions: 12" wide by 25" deep by 12" high.
COUPLERS Weight: 70 Ibs.
Maximum Working Pressure: 4,900 psi.
LIVE SWIVEL
BALL VALVES PCG707 230V Converter Kit
ACCESSORIES Converts crimper and pump
_ Product Number: 7482-0499
EQUIPMENT
AND PARTS

gates.com/hydraulics
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HOSE/CPLG.
SELECTION

GBK
COUPLINGS

~ GLUBALSPIRAL |
COUPLINGS

PCM/PCS
FERRULES

MEGAGRIMP
COUPLINGS

STAINLESS
STEEL

POWER
CRIMP
COUPLINGS

LOC, GL AND
GLP
COUPLINGS

POLARSEAL
COUPLINGS

POLARSEAL
1l COUPLINGS

ct4
COUPLINGS

PCTS
THERMO-
PEASTIC
COUPLINGS

FIELD
ATTACHABLE
G1AND G2
COUPLINGS

FIELD
ATTAGHABLE
G5 AND C5E
COUPLINGS
SURELOK AIR
BRAKE
COUPLINGS
ADAPTERS
QUICK
DISCONNECT
COUPLERS
LIVE SWIVEL
BALL VALVES

ACCESSORIES

EQUIPMENT
AND PARTS

Work Bench

Product Number: 7484-0020 i

Dimensions: 36" wide by 24" deep by 36" tall V7

This new hydraul:c work bench is ideal for holdmg e:ther the — ‘ \J s
Pow imp® 707 or MohileCrimp® 4-20 crimpe iz

hydraultc saws. The lower shelf can be used for storage or

as shown with the pump. It is made of an angle iron frame

construction with a high-density fiberboard top and welded
13-gauge steel lower shelf, All hardware is included to allow
for easy assembly in about 10 minutes.

Hydraulic Coupling B
Product Number: 7484-0007

The 24-bin cabinet is constructed of heavy gauge steel.
Cabinet measures 34" wide by 24" high by 12" deep.
Excellent for storing large 1-1/4" to 2” 1.D. couplings.

Coupling Bin Boxes
Bin boxes for hydraulic couplings. Corrugated

cardboard design gives extra strength. Includes
four dividers per box.

Product Number: 7484-0008
Measures: 5" wide by 4-1/2" high by 117 deep.

Product Number: Y484-0009
Measures: 7-1/2" wide by 4-1/2" high by 11" deep.

——
— —

_Gates Hose Cutter Model 2-24

For two-wire braid hose through 1-1/2" ID.
Product Number: 7480-6600
Clean Easy Culs - Safe Operation

FEATURES:
Cuts up to 1-1/2" |.D. two-wire braid reinforced hose.

Designed to operate on standard 20 amp service.

8 Reversible 8" scalloped-edge, high-speed steel blade
with 5/8" bore can be sharpened.

| Radius hose feed into blade for safety and reduced friction.

Inner blade guard for safe operation.

SPECIFIGATIONS

Power Source: 1-1/2 HP (2.6 HP Peak), 115V, 80 Hz., Repiacement Blade

15 Amp motor with power cord and plug. Product Number: 7793-0113
Dimensions: 13" wide by 24" length by 17" high.

Weight: 65 |bs.

o

Gates Corporation %
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J.G.B. Enterprises, Inc.
Hydraulic Equipment Lease with Option to Purchase

Attachment 1
Payment Schedule

Yearly lease payment of $1.00 (One Dollar and 00/100) is based on yearly purchase of
hydraulic hose and fittings of $5000.00 or more. If lessee does not maintain a8 minimum
purchase of $5000.00 per year, the schedule below will be used in determining the lease

payment for the following year.

$4,000-4999 $250.00 per year
$3,000-3999 $500.00 per year
$2,000-2999 $750.00 per year

If the sales are less than $2,000 J.G.B. Enterprises, Inc. reserves the right to remove the
crimper from the LESSEE’s site, or the LESSEE may opt to purchase the crimper for the
amount specified in the lease agreement, line item 4:ai.

LESSOR: J.G.B. Enterprises, Inc. LESSEE:

Signature: Signature
Authorized Signature

Printed Name: Printed Name:

Title: Title:

Date: Date:




Current Ole Stock Lift Out

Tractor Trailer Supply Co. with the cooperation of Goodyear MFG will lift the
old inventory consisting of crimp fittings and hoses. The product price of the return will

be at the net price of the bid.

In order for Tractor Trailer Supply Co. and Goodyear MFG to supply the
requested crimpers on a loan program; the value of the return must be $40,000.00. For
amounts under $40,000.00, the equipment will be prorated. For example, if the return is
only valued at $36,000.00, Tractor Trailer Supply Co. covers 90% of the cost of

equipment, and Jefferson County will cover 10%.



1 Each -~ PC125

Hose Machine Requested

Stationary Crimper

_$2274.02

PC125-Skit

$3046.16

5 Each — PC125M

Portable Crimper

$1145.88

PC125M-Skit
PC125

$1918.48
$441.72

2 Each—-PC125M

Hand Pump Crimper

$1145.88

PC125M-Skit
PC125

$1918.47

$256.37

1 Each — Dewalt 14” DWT-D28715

Chop Saw

$222.16




