
BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

COMMENTS: A-2000

15" NO BID NO BID $7.80 NO BID $7.78

18" $10.64 $10.61

21" $14.39 $14.36

24" $18.07 $18.03

30" $26.45 $26.39

36" $35.94 $35.85

15" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.56

18" $9.85

21" $15.74

24" $16.06

30" $27.11

30" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.74

36" $36.06

42" $45.43

48" $55.85

54" N/A

60" $88.37

15" NO BID NO BID $7.78 NO BID $6.54

18" $10.73 $8.50

21" NO BID N/A

24" $17.68 $14.58

30" $27.11 $20.66

36" $33.16 $27.47

42" $38.92 $36.64

48" $50.88 $44.79

54" NO BID N/A

60" NO BID $67.37

COMMENTS: DUROMAX

15" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A

18" NO BID N/A

21" NO BID N/A

24" NO BID N/A

30" $49.26 $51.73

36" $61.01 $64.06

42" $71.80 $75.39

48" $80.62 $84.66

54" $91.49 $96.07

60" $129.00 $135.45

66" $201.46 N/A

72" $216.75 N/A

84" $323.44 N/A

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

POLYVINYL CHLORIDE (PVC) - COST PER FOOT (PAGE 11)

POLYPROPYLENE PIPE (DOUBLE WALLED) - COST PER FOOT (PAGE 12)

POLYPROPYLENE PIPE (TRIPLE WALLED) - COST PER FOOT (PAGE 12)

POLYETHTLENE PIPE - CORRUGATED - COST PER FOOT (PAGE 13)

POLYETHTLENE PIPE - STEEL REINFORCED - COST PER FOOT (PAGE 13)

REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE - ROUND PIPES (PAGE 14)



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

MINIMUM DELIVERY REQUIRED: NO BID

YES/ $600.00 

UNDER FULL 

LOAD

NO BID NO YES

COMMENTS

QUOTE BASED ON 

TRUCK LOAD 

LOTS. 

ALL PIPE QUOTED 

IN 8' LENGTHS.

SMALL LOAD 

DELIVERY CHARGE 

WILL BE ADDED TO 

SMALL LOAD 

(VARIES). PAILS OF 

LUBRICANT & 

SEWERTITE $45.00/ 

PAIL. MINIMUM 3 

WKS NOTICE ON 

ELLIPTICAL 

PURCHASES. 

MINIMUM 3 DAY 

NOTICE FOR ALL 

SCHEDULED 

DELIVERIES

AMOUNT WILL 

VARY BASED ON 

PIPE SIZE PER 

LOAD

15" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18"

21"

24"

30"

36"

42"

48"

54"

60"

72"

84"

96"

15" NO BID $12.62 NO BID $96.80 NO BID

18" $16.24 $127.20

21" $20.39 $185.20

24" $24.45 $185.20

30" $34.99 $269.60

36" $46.83 $390.00

42" $72.24 $489.60

48" $76.90 $616.80

54" $109.74 $785.60

60" $132.20 $942.80

72" $181.45 $1,402.00

84" $229.84 $2,117.60

96"
UPON REQUEST 

ONLY
$2,670.00

15" NO BID $433.13 NO BID $330.00 NO BID

18" $553.44 $363.00

21" $618.75 $462.00

24" $741.13 $495.00

30" $914.38 $682.00

36" $986.56 $1,116.50

42" $1,294.56 $984.50

CLASS III PRICE PER 7.5' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS III PRICE PER 8' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS III FLARED END SECTION (PAGE 15)



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

48" $1,576.09 $1,171.50

54" $1,982.75 $1,667.00

60" $3,000.94 $1,930.50

72" $4,571.88 $5,054.50

84" $6,242.50 $9,000.00

96"
UPON REQUEST 

ONLY

UPON REQUEST 

ONLY

15" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18"

21"

24"

30"

36"

42"

48"

54"

60"

72"

84"

96"

15" NO BID $17.81 NO BID $116.80 NO BID

18" $22.93 $151.60

21" $28.78 $185.20

24" $36.06 $258.00

30" $51.61 $404.80

36" $69.06 $662.40

42" $106.52 $736.00

48" $137.74 $881.60

54" $206.97 $1,118.80

60" $249.34 $1,345.20

72" $370.95 $1,002.80

84" SPECIAL DESIGN
UPON REQUEST 

ONLY

96"
UPON REQUEST 

ONLY

UPON REQUEST 

ONLY

15" NO BID $433.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID

18" $553.44

21" $618.75

24" $741.13

30" $914.38

36" $986.56

42" $1,294.56

48" $1,576.09

54" $1,982.75

60" $3,000.94

72" $4,571.88

84" $6,242.50

96"
UPON REQUEST 

ONLY

CLASS V PRICE PER 7.5' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS V PRICE PER 8' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS V FLARED END SECTION (PAGE 15)



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

18" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

24"

30"

36"

42"

48"

60"

72" $2,842.00

84" $5,186.00

96" $5,650.00

COMMENTS HE III

18" NO BID $31.99 NO BID $366.00 $447.00

24" $55.78 $440.00 $532.00

30" $70.45 $611.60 $696.00

36" $102.54 $734.00 $841.00

42" $139.16 $943.20 $1,032.00

48" $166.60 $1,138.00 $1,260.00

60" $255.12 $1,670.00 $1,814.00

72" $344.69 N/A

84" NO BID N/A

96" NO BID N/A

18" NO BID $664.13 NO BID $457.00 $385.00

24" $889.36 $584.00 $500.00

30" $1,097.26 $748.00 $588.00

36" $1,183.88 $1,243.50 $975.00

42" $1,941.84 $1,580.00 $1,180.00

48" $2,364.50 $1,955.60 $1,415.00

60" $4,501.41 $3,771.15 $2,706.00

72" $6,857.81 N/A

84" NO BID N/A

96" NO BID N/A

COMMENTS: CLASS IV

18" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

24"

30"

36"

42"

48"

60"

72" $3,286.00

84" $6,269.00

96" $7,197.00

COMMENTS HE V CLASS IV

REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE - ELLIPTICAL PIPES (PAGE 15)

CLASS III PRICE PER 8' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS III FLARED END SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS III PRICE PER 7.5' SECTION

CLASS V PRICE PER 7.5' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS V PRICE PER 8' SECTION (PAGE 15)



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

18" NO BID $35.00 NO BID NO BID $466.00

24" $59.50 $560.00

30" $75.25 $741.00

36" $109.38 $905.00

42" $148.75 $1,178.00

48" $232.06 $1,514.00

60" $331.65 $2,332.00

72" $435.09

84" NO BID

96" NO BID

18" NO BID $644.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID

24" $889.36

30" $1,097.26

36" $1,183.88

42" $1,941.84

48" $2,364.50

60" $4,501.41

72" $6,857.81

84" NO BID

96" NO BID

MINIMUM DELIVERY REQUIRED: NO NO BID YES NO BID YES

COMMENTS:

VARIES PER 

DIAMETER. 

TRUCKS TO BE 

REASONABLY 

FULL.

AMOUNT WILL 

VARY BASED ON 

PIPE SIZE PER 

LOAD

15" - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED NO BID ZINC NO BID ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $10.37 $10.51 $10.51

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $10.37 $15.76 $15.77

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $53.55 $58.00 $58.39

18" - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $12.26 $12.61 $12.61

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $12.26 $18.91 $18.92

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $69.40 $75.10 $75.71

21" - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $14.60 $14.71 $14.71

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $14.60 $22.07 $22.07

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $83.50 $90.34 $91.06

24" - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $16.35 $16.81 $16.81

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $16.35 $25.22 $25.22

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $103.55 $112.10 $113.00

30" - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $20.08 $21.02 $21.03

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $30.12 $31.52 $31.55

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $174.70 $204.60 $206.25

36" COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $33.12 $33.84 $33.85

METALLIC COATED RIVETED PIPE (2 2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION) (PAGE 17)

CORRUGATED METALLIC CULVERT PIPE (PAGE 16)

CLASS V FLARED END SECTION (PAGE 15)



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $49.68 $50.76 $50.78

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $281.55 $329.81 $332.46

42" - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $38.81 $39.37 $39.37

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $58.22 $59.05 $59.06

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $644.95 $625.00 $627.05

48" COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $44.21 $44.89 $44.90

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $66.32 $67.34 $67.35

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $736.70 $724.00 $730.80

COMMENTS:
NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

15" - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED N/A ZINC N/A ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $11.22 $8.98 $8.98

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $11.22 $13.46

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $92.10 $58.00

18" - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $13.27 $10.75 $10.76

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $13.27 $16.13

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $119.35 $75.10

21" - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $15.80 $12.59 $12.59

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $15.80 $18.89

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $143.65 $90.34

24" - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $17.70 $14.87 $14.87

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $17.70 $22.30

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $178.20 $112.10

30" - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $21.73 $17.96 $17.96

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $32.60 $26.93

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $325.25 $204.60

36" COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $35.88 $28.81 $28.82

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $53.82 $43.22

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $524.30 $329.81

42" - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $42.04 $33.52 $33.52

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $63.06 $50.27

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $988.95 $625.00

48" COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $47.87 $38.22 $38.22

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $71.81 $57.33

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,150.90 $724.00

54" - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED NO BID ZINC NO BID ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $60.08 $65.05 $65.05

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $120.16 $97.57 $97.58

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $906.05 $858.00 $864.87

METALLIC COATED RIVETED PIPE (3" X 1" CORRUGATION) (PAGE 17)

METALLIC COATED RIVETED PIPE (2 2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION) (EXTRA PAGE 17)



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

60"- COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $65.78 $72.10 $72.11

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $131.56 $108.15 $108.17

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,359.10 $1,286.50 $1,297.31

66"- COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $71.78 $79.16 $79.16

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $143.56 $118.73 $118.74

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,461.00 $1,384.00 $1,394.59

72"- COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $78.15 $86.23 $86.21

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $156.30 $129.31 $129.32

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,619.60 $1,533.70 $1,545.97

84"- COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $90.98 $103.00 $103.01

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $181.96 $154.51 $154.52

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,914.00 $1,812.50 $1,827.05

96"- COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $103.80 $118.29 $118.30

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $207.60 $177.44 $177.45

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,539.25 $2,403.75 $2,423.81

108"- COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $148.65 $161.87 $161.88

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $297.30 $242.81 $242.82

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

120"- COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $165.00 $179.44 $179.44

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $330.00 $269.15 $269.16

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

COMMENTS:
NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

54" - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED N/A ZINC N/A ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $64.88 $50.11 $50.12

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $129.76 $75.17

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,364.00 $858.00

60"- COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $71.04 $56.41 $56.42

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $142.08 $84.62

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,046.00 $1,286.50

66"- COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $77.52 $61.83 $61.83

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $155.04 $92.74

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,199.50 $1,384.00

72"- COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $84.40 $67.22 $67.23

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $168.80 $100.83

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,438.20 $1,533.70

84"- COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $98.25 $75.26 $75.27

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $196.50 $112.90

METALLIC COATED RIVETED PIPE (3" X 1" CORRUGATION) (EXTRA PAGE 17)



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,881.50 $1,812.50

96"- COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $112.10 $86.90 $86.90

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $224.20 $130.35

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $3,822.65 $2,403.75

108"- COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $160.54 $123.99 $124.00

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $321.08 $185.98

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

120"- COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $178.20 $136.45 $136.50

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $356.40 $204.68

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

17X13 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED NO BID ZINC NO BID ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $11.02 $11.14 $11.14

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $11.02 $16.71 $16.71

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $49.25 $58.28 $58.75

21X25 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $12.92 $13.37 $13.37

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $12.92 $20.05 $20.06

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $57.75 $14.70 $68.88

24X18 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $15.33 $15.59 $15.60

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $15.33 $23.39 $23.40

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $70.25 $16.43 $83.80

28X20 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $17.23 $17.82 $17.82

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $17.23 $26.73 $26.73

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $82.75 $97.94 $98.73

35X24 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $28.73 $30.04 $30.04

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $43.10 $45.06 $45.06

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $154.40 $164.10 $165.42

42X29 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $34.13 $35.90 $35.90

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $51.20 $53.85 $53.85

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $229.25 $259.56 $261.64

49X33 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $39.96 $41.76 $41.76

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $59.94 $62.64 $62.64

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $412.15 $447.24 $450.82

57X38 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $45.43 $47.62 $47.63

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $68.15 $71.44 $71.45

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $588.95 $557.70 $562.16

COMMENTS:
NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

17X13 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED N/A ZINC N/A ZINC

METALLIC COATED RIVETED PIPE ARCH (2 2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION) (PAGE 18)
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BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

COST PER FOOT: $11.93 $9.61 $9.61

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $11.93 $14.41

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $92.65 $58.28

21X25 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $13.98 $11.57 $11.51

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $13.98 $17.26

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $108.65 $14.70

24X18 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $16.59 $13.47 $13.48

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $16.59 $20.21

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $132.20 $16.43

28X20 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $18.64 $15.87 $15.88

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $18.64 $23.81

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $155.70 $97.94

35X24 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $31.12 $26.26 $26.26

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $46.68 $39.39

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $260.90 $164.10

42X29 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $36.97 $30.87 $30.87

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $55.46 $46.31

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $412.65 $259.56

49X33 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $43.29 $35.91 $35.91

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $64.94 $53.87

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $711.00 $447.24

57X38 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $49.22 $40.95 $40.95

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $73.83 $61.42

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $886.60 $557.70

60X46 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED NO BID ZINC NO BID ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $61.73 $67.66 $67.67

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $123.46 $101.50 $101.51

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $805.30 $795.00 $802.16

66X51 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $67.65 $75.00 $75.01

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $135.30 $112.50 $112.52

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,063.65 $1,051.25 $1,059.45

73X55 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $73.88 $82.34 $82.35

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $147.76 $123.51 $123.53

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,427.25 $1,141.25 $1,421.65

81X59 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $80.63 $89.67 $89.67

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $161.26 $134.51 $134.51

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,503.25 $1,485.00 $1,497.34

95X67 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

METALLIC COATED RIVETED PIPE ARCH (3" X 1" CORRUGATION) (PAGE 18)



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

COST PER FOOT: $94.73 $107.04 $107.04

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $189.46 $160.55 $160.56

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,682.35 $1,162.00 $1,675.72

112X75 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $108.83 $122.92 $122.93

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $217.72 $184.39 $184.40

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,179.40 $2,153.00 $2,170.82

128X83 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $122.55 $168.55 $168.56

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $245.10 $252.83 $252.84

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A N/A

142X91 - COATING TYPE: GALVANIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $137.10 $186.84 $186.84

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $274.20 $280.26 $280.26

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A N/A

COMMENTS:
NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

60X46 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED N/A ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $66.66 $52.73 $52.74

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $133.32 $79.09

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,265.10 $795.00

66X51 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $73.06 $59.31 $59.32

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $146.12 $88.97

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,670.90 $1,051.25

73X55 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $79.79 $65.00 $65.01

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $159.58 $97.51

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,242.10 $1,411.25

81X59 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $87.08 $70.69 $70.69

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $174.16 $106.02

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,361.40 $1,485.00

95X67 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $102.30 $77.95 $77.96

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $204.60 $116.93

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,642.85 $1,662.00

112X75 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $117.53 $89.99 $90.00

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $235.06 $134.98

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $3,423.70 $2,153.00

128X83 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $167.51 $121.76 $121.76

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $335.02 $182.64

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

142X91 - COATING TYPE: ALUMINIZED ZINC ZINC

COST PER FOOT: $189.95 $133.99 $134.00

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $379.90 $200.98

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

METALLIC COATED RIVETED PIPE ARCH (3" X 1" CORRUGATION) (EXTRA PAGE 18)



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

15" - COST PER FOOT $13.21 NO BID $13.60 NO BID $13.60

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $13.21 $20.39 $20.40

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $53.55 N/A

18" - COST PER FOOT $15.62 $16.31 $16.32

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $15.62 $24.47 $24.48

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $69.40 N/A

21" - COST PER FOOT $18.60 $19.03 $19.04

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $18.60 $28.55 $28.56

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $83.50 N/A

24" - COST PER FOOT $20.83 $21.75 $21.76

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $20.83 $32.63 $32.64

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $103.55 N/A

30" - COST PER FOOT $25.58 $27.82 $27.83

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $38.37 $41.73 $41.75

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $174.70 N/A

36" - COST PER FOOT $41.86 $45.44 $45.45

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $62.79 $68.16 $68.18

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $281.55 N/A

42" - COST PER FOOT $49.05 $52.86 $52.86

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $73.58 $79.29 $79.29

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $644.95 N/A

48" - COST PER FOOT $55.87 $60.28 $60.28

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $83.81 $90.42 $90.42

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $736.70 N/A

COMMENTS:
NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

15" - COST PER FOOT N/A N/A $11.81 N/A $11.82

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $17.72

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

18" - COST PER FOOT $13.99 $13.99

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $20.98

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

21" - COST PER FOOT $16.54 $16.54

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $24.81

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

24" - COST PER FOOT $18.65 $18.65

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $27.98

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

30" - COST PER FOOT $23.31 $23.31

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $34.97

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

36" - COST PER FOOT $38.07 $38.08

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $57.11

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

42" - COST PER FOOT $44.29 $44.29

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $66.43

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

48" - COST PER FOOT $50.50 $50.51

POLYMER COATED RIVETED PIPE (2 2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION) (EXTRA PAGE 19)
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BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $75.76

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

54" - COST PER FOOT $75.29 NO BID $87.25 NO BID $87.26

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $150.58 $130.88 $130.89

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $906.05 N/A

60" - COST PER FOOT $82.44 $96.72 $96.72

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $164.88 $145.07 $145.08

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,359.10 N/A

66" - COST PER FOOT $89.96 $106.18 $106.18

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $179.92 $159.27 $159.27

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,461.00 N/A

72" - COST PER FOOT $97.95 $115.64 $115.64

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $195.90 $173.46 $173.46

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,619.60 N/A

84" - COST PER FOOT $114.02 $137.25 $137.25

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $228.04 $205.87 $205.88

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,914.00 N/A

96" - COST PER FOOT $130.10 $157.62 $157.63

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $260.20 $236.43 $236.45

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,539.25 N/A

108" - COST PER FOOT $186.31 $225.14 $225.15

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $372.62 $337.71 $337.73

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A N/A

120" - COST PER FOOT $206.80 $249.56 $249.57

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $413.60 $374.34 $274.36

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A N/A

COMMENTS:
NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

54" - COST PER FOOT N/A N/A $70.16 N/A $70.17

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $105.23

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

60" - COST PER FOOT $77.67 $77.67

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $116.50

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

66" - COST PER FOOT $85.16 $85.16

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $127.74

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

72" - COST PER FOOT $92.63 $92.64

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $139.00

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

84" - COST PER FOOT $106.18 $106.18

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $159.26

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

96" - COST PER FOOT $120.86 $120.86

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $181.28

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

108" - COST PER FOOT $168.51 $168.51

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $252.76

POLYMER COATED RIVETED PIPE (3" X 1" CORRUGATION) (EXTRA PAGE 19)
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BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

120" - COST PER FOOT $185.80 $185.81

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $278.70

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

17X13 - COST PER FOOT $14.04 NO BID $14.23 NO BID $14.23

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $14.04 $21.33 $21.35

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $49.25 N/A

21X15 - COST PER FOOT $16.46 $17.07 $17.08

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $16.46 $25.61 $25.62

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $57.75 N/A

24X18 - COST PER FOOT $19.53 $19.92 $19.92

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $19.53 $29.87 $29.88

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $70.25 N/A

28X20 - COST PER FOOT $21.95 $22.76 $22.77

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $21.95 $34.14 $34.16

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $82.75 N/A

35X24 - COST PER FOOT $36.31 $39.43 $39.75

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $54.47 $59.62 $59.63

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $154.40 N/A

42X29 - COST PER FOOT $43.13 $47.50 $47.51

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $64.70 $71.25 $71.27

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $229.25 N/A

49X33 - COST PER FOOT $50.51 $55.25 $55.26

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $75.77 $82.89 $82.29

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $412.15 N/A

57X38 - COST PER FOOT $57.42 $63.01 $63.01

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $86.13 $94.51 $94.52

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $588.95 N/A

COMMENTS:
NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

17X13 - COST PER FOOT N/A N/A $12.44 N/A $12.45

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $18.66

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

21X15 - COST PER FOOT $14.74 $14.75

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $22.11

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

24X18 - COST PER FOOT $17.42 $17.42

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $26.13

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

28X20 - COST PER FOOT $19.66 $19.66

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $29.48

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

35X24 - COST PER FOOT $33.58 $33.58

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $50.37

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

42X29 - COST PER FOOT $40.13 $40.14

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $60.20

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

POLYMER COATED RIVETED PIPE ARCH (2 2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION) (EXTRA PAGE 20)
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BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

49X33 - COST PER FOOT $46.68 $46.69

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $70.02

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

57X38 - COST PER FOOT $53.24 $53.24

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $79.85

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

60X46 - COST PER FOOT $77.36 NO BID $89.86 NO BID $89.87

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $154.72 $134.80 $134.81

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $805.30 N/A

66X51 - COST PER FOOT $84.79 $99.61 $99.62

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $169.58 $149.42 $149.43

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,063.65 N/A

73X55 - COST PER FOOT $92.59 $109.36 $109.36

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $185.18 $164.04 $164.04

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,427.25 N/A

81X59 - COST PER FOOT $101.05 $119.10 $119.11

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $202.10 $178.66 $178.67

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,503.25 N/A

95X67 - COST PER FOOT $118.72 $141.28 $141.28

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $237.44 $211.92 $211.92

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $1,682.35 N/A

112X75 - COST PER FOOT $136.39 $162.25 $162.26

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $272.78 $243.38 $243.39

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): $2,179.40 N/A

128X83 - COST PER FOOT $194.39 $233.99 $234.00

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $388.78 $350.99 $351.00

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A N/A

142X91 - COST PER FOOT $220.43 $259.38 $259.39

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $440.86 $389.88 $389.09

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A N/A

COMMENTS:
NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

NOT RIVETED, 

HELCOR

60X46 - COST PER FOOT N/A N/A $73.21 N/A $73.21

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $109.81

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

66X51 - COST PER FOOT $81.14 $81.15

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $121.71

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

73X55 - COST PER FOOT $88.34 $88.34

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $132.51

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

81X59 - COST PER FOOT $96.10 $96.10

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $144.14

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

95X67 - COST PER FOOT $110.21 $110.21

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $165.13

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

112X75 - COST PER FOOT $125.49 $125.49

POLYMER COATED RIVETED PIPE ARCH (3" X 1" CORRUGATION) (EXTRA PAGE 20)
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BID TABULATION - ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

METAL 

CULVERTS, INC.

COUNTY 

MATERIALS 

CORP.

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

4951 BROCKWOOD 

DR ST LOUIS MO 

63128

110 FORD LANE 

HAZELWOOD MO 

63042

4855 

BAUMGARTNER RD 

ST LOUIS MO 63129

1435 N BLUFF RD 

COLLINSVILLE IL 

62234

BID TABULATIONS

IFB - ROADWAY DRAINAGE 

PIPE

BID OPENING DATE

12-8-15

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $188.23

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

128X83 - COST PER FOOT $175.19 $175.19

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $262.78

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

142X91 - COST PER FOOT $193.21 $193.21

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): $289.81

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): N/A

NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT 

COMPLETED
Y Y N Y Y

E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION 

(Y/N):
N N N Y N

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED Y Y Y Y Y

TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED 

LETTER STATING NO REAL OR 

PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN 

JEFFERSON COUNTY

Y Y Y Y Y

COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y

COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y Y Y

COMPANY INFORMATION AND 

SIGNATURE
Y Y Y Y Y

BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

COMMENTS: SEE ATTACHED SEE ATTACHED

MISSING PAGE 15

SEE ATTACHED

SEE ATTACHED SEE ATTACHED

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS


































































































































